
Requirements for Voluntary Family Planning Projects, The Tiahrt Amendment 
1999 Foreign Operations Appropriations Act 

That any such voluntary family planning project shall meet the following requirements: 

(1) service providers or referral agents in the project shall not implement or be subject to 
quotas, or other numerical targets, of total number of births, number of family planning 
acceptors, or acceptors of a particular method of family planning (this provision shall not 
be construed to include the use of quantitative estimates or indicators for budgeting and 
planning purposes), 

(2) the project shall not include payment of incentives, bribes, gratuities, or financial 
reward to (A) an individual in exchange for becoming a family planning acceptor, or (B) 
program personnel for achieving a numerical target or quota of total number of births, 
number of family planning acceptors, or acceptors of a particular method of family 
planning, 

(3) the project shall not deny any right or benefit, including the right of access to 
participate in any program of general welfare or the right of access to health care, as a 
consequence of any individual's decision not to accept family planning services, 

(4) the project shall provide family planning acceptors comprehensible information on 
the health benefits and risks of the method chosen, including those conditions that might 
render the use of the method inadvisable and those adverse side effects known to be 
consequent to the use of the method, 

and, (5) the project shall ensure that experimental contraceptive drugs and devices and 
medical procedures are provided only in the context of a scientific study in which 
participants are advised of potential risks and benefits; and, not less than 60 days after the 
date on which the Administrator of the United States Agency for International 
Development determines that there has been a violation of the requirements contained in 
paragraphs (1), (2), (3), or (5) of this proviso, or a pattern or practice of violations of the 
requirements contained in paragraph (4) of this proviso, the Administrator shall submit to 
the Committee on International Relations and the Committee on Appropriations of the 
House of Representatives and to the Committee on Foreign Relations and the Committee 
on Appropriations of the Senate, a report containing a description of such violation and 
the corrective action taken by the Agency. 


